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Diagnosing eosinophilic esophagitis

Diagnosticando la esofagitis eosinofílica

To the Editor,

We recently read this interesting article in the 
journal: Esofagitis eosinofílica: diagnóstico y manejo1. 
After its description, eosinophilic esophagitis (EoE) 
has become an epidemiological and editorial pheno-
menon2. We would like to highlight several points, 
including those related to the definition of EoE. This 
has gone through some stages; the first diagnostic guide 
was done in 2007 and was updated in 2011. The last 
international consensus for the diagnostic criteria of 
EoE was carried out in 20183 and indicates that several 
aspects are necessary: - the presence of symptoms of 
esophageal dysfunction, - in esophageal histology 

the presence of ≥ 15 eosinophils per high-power field 
(hpf). Eosinophilic infiltration should be isolated to the 
esophagus. Other aspects, such as endoscopic findings 
and atopic comorbidities increase the diagnostic sus-
picion, but they are not essential and may be absent. 
In theTop of Form article published1, the diseases that 
cause or may contribute to esophageal eosinophilia 
are listed, and it is stated that according to the 2013 
guidelines, these should be excluded. However, in the 
2018 consensus, in addition to including PPI-responsive 
esophageal eosinophilia within the spectrum of EoE, it 
is stated that the diseases listed as conditions associated 
with esophageal eosinophilia should be evaluated rather 
than require their exclusion, since they can coexist in 
some cases, such as gastroesophageal reflux disease 
(GERD), which is one of the most complex differential 
diagnoses3. The esophageal motility disorders can also 
be clinically difficult to differentiate and an overlap has 
been described4. Other causes of esophageal eosinophi-
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lia are rare or have distinctive clinical features. In this 
regard, it is useful to take gastric and duodenal biopsy 
samples, which are always recommended in pediatric 
guidelines, and in adults, symptoms and endoscopic 
findings must be taken into account to obtain them. 
Since EoE is the same disease in children as in adults, 
the diagnostic criteria are applicable to all age groups3.

Regarding epidemiology, we would like to point 
out that although the authors of the article1 did not 
find important epidemiological studies of EoE in adults 
within the Latin American region, there are studies in 
the pediatric population carried out by the Latin Ameri-
can Society for Pediatric Gastroenterology, Hepatology 
and Nutrition (LASPGHAN). A multicenter study (36 
centers in 10 Latin American countries) determined a 
general prevalence rate of 3.69 x 1000. In those submi-
tted to endoscopy, it was 26 x 1000. Although not all 
the countries of the region are represented, it is inte-
resting to note that the prevalence showed significant 
variability between the participating countries and 
centers. Mexico, Central America (Salvador), and the 
Andean region (Peru and Ecuador) were identified with 
low prevalence. The North Caribbean (Venezuela) and 
the Southern Cone (Uruguay, Argentina, and Chile) 
presented intermediate prevalence; the highest was re-
ported in Brazil, followed by Colombia. When analyzing 
the epidemiology of the region, it is suggested to take 
into account that Latin America is a very heterogeneous 
area, with great ethnic and socioeconomic development 
variability of the different countries, this can influence 
the prevalence. EoE occurs more frequently in urban 
populations with higher socioeconomic status, which 
may also be reflected in some countries and sectors of 
the population in Latin America. The uneven develop-
ment of the specialty of gastroenterology and digestive 
endoscopy is also involved2.

Regarding the clinical picture, in pediatric age it 
may be more complex to have a diagnostic suspicion ba-
sed on symptoms, since, especially in younger children, 
symptoms may be more nonspecific. The spectrum of 
symptoms is also greater at a younger age and more 
difficult to define since they depend on the interpre-
tation of their caregivers and require a questioning 
directed by the doctor. Thus, in infants and younger 
children, symptoms can be vague or ambiguous, in-
cludes feeding difficulties like aversion, rejection or 
intolerance to food, choking with meals, vomiting, 
regurgitation, weight loss, failure to thrive, cough, and 
sleep disturbance. In school children, dysphagia can 
already be reported in the directed questioning, food 
impaction, choking /gagging with coarse textures of 
food, abdominal or chest pain, odynophagia, as well as 
symptoms compatible with GERD such as regurgitation 
and heartburn, vomiting, nausea, sleep disturbance, 
and decreased appetite. In adolescents and adults, the 
most characteristic symptoms of EoE are reported more 

frequently, such as dysphagia and impaction of food, 
in addition to food avoidance, intractable heartburn, 
regurgitation, and retrosternal or chest pain4. Therefore, 
in the presence of esophageal symptoms, always take a 
biopsy sample of the esophagus in distal and middle/ 
proximal thirds to be evaluated.

Finally, due to its use in several studies, we mention 
scores that can favor the diagnosis and follow-up of 
EoE, and above all, scientific research, since the findings 
take a quantitative value. In the EoE Endoscopic Refe-
rence Score described by Hirano et al5, the findings are 
quantified according to severity, it is called EREFS by its 
english acronym: Edema 0-2 points, Rings 0-3 points, 
Exudates 0-2 points, longitudinal Furrows 0-2 points, 
Stenosis 0-1 point. With a maximum of 10 points, the 
higher values ​​represent greater endoscopic severity. 
Although the findings of mucosal friability, crepe pa-
per mucosa in EoE have also been described, these are 
not included in the endoscopic score. Recently there 
have also been several publications on a histological 
score (EoE Histology Scoring System: EoE HSS)6, with 
studies that suggest its superiority compared to the 
peak of the eosinophil count. This incorporates items 
like eosinophilic inflammation, basal zone hyperplasia, 
eosinophil abscess, eosinophil surface layering, dilated 
intercellular space, surface epithelial alteration, dys-
keratotic epithelial cells and lamina propria fibrosis. 
This score has not yet become generalized in routine 
diagnostic practice; perhaps more prospective studies 
are necessary before its general use.
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